Freedom of Information (Scotland) Act 2002

DATE RECEIVED | 12/04/2022 | SUBJECT | Pulmonary Rehab Services

PASSED TO | Community Health | DATE PASSED | 13/04 2022 | RESPOND BY | 03/05/2022
and Social Care
Information

CATEGORY | Private | Fol NUMBER | 2022-133

Question/s to be Answered

I'd like to please request the following information with regards to the pulmonary

rehab services your patients have access to.

1) Who commissions the Pulmonary Rehab services your patients have access
to and who provides these services?

Services are not commissioned and there is no specific Pulmonary Rehab
service, people referred with a need are seen within the general physio service.

2) When did the services first commence?
No specific service exists

3) How many patients have been referred to the service in the last 12 months
and 24 months of data held?

The patients are not clearly identified and are included in general non MSK
physio.

4) Of these being referred how many have actually attended the service in these
same time periods?

Not recorded. Information not held.
5) How long does the average patient stay within the services?
This will depend on individual patients and is not collected. Information not held.
6) What is the current waiting list size for the service?
No waiting list.
7) What is the current remaining contract durations for these services?
No contract in place.
8) Has the CCG ever commissioned Digital Respiratory Services?
CCG does not apply in Scotland.

If so were these for Pulmonary Rehab?

Not applicable

If so who were the providers?
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Not applicable
If so how many patients have utilised this digital element?

Not applicable



