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Question/s to be answered 

Please provide data for:  

1. To date, the number of people diagnosed with long Covid in your health board area, broken 
down by age, gender and any other demographic group.  

In accordance with FOISA s 17(1), NHS Shetland confirms that it does not hold the 
information requested. 

2. To date, the number of people who are being treated as a long Covid patient in your health 
board area. 

In accordance with FOISA s 17(1), NHS Shetland confirms that it does not hold the 
information requested. 

3. Please also provide a copy of your health board’s submission to the Scottish Government’s 
strategic network on managing the long term effects of Covid-19 for how you intend to utilise 
Long Covid Support Funding, including any specific request for funding/budgets. 

Please see attached document (13a) 
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