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Question/s to be answered

1. To ask the Health Board the number of shifts in each of the last 12 months where bank,
agency or guild staff cover was required?

In accordance with FOISA s 17(1), NHS Shetland confirms that it does not hold the
information requested.

2. How many of these shifts were filled/unfilled?

In accordance with FOISA s 17(1), NHS Shetland confirms that it does not hold the
information requested

3. What has the overall spend been on bank, agency and guild staff cover in each of the last 12
months broken down by each category?

Agency

Aug-21 537,084
Sep-21 387,497
Oct-21 574,198
Nov-21 408,695
Dec-21 395,597
Jan-22 647,056
Feb-22 834,396
Mar-22 956,595
Apr-22 712,091
May-22 696,959
Jun-22 431,565

Jul-22 370,272

Bank

Aug-21 262,558
Sep-21 226,392

Oct-21 309,223
Nov-21 286,249
Dec-21 250,626
Jan-22 313,626
Feb-22 436,679
Mar-22 393,999
Apr-22 244,603
May-22 251,682
Jun-22 438,024

Jul-22 314,958

Guild, Zero
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