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Primary Care 
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Category of information 
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H&SC Delivery - Pharmacy 

Question/s to be answered 

1. How many patients have been treated with the following drugs in the past 4 months: 

a) Erenumab (Aimovig) - any disease    

6 patients 

b) Fremanezumab (Ajovy) - any disease    

0 patients 

c) Galcanezumab (Emgality) - any disease  

0 patients 

d) Botulinum Toxin (i.e., Botox, Dysport, Xeomin) - migraine ONLY   

In accordance with FOISA s 17(1), NHS Shetland confirms that it does not hold the 

information requested as we have treated patients using this drug but for a variety of 

conditions and are unable to provide numbers for migraine. 

2. How many patients have you treated in the last 4 months for chronic migraine (15+ 

headache days per month) and episodic migraine (4-15 headache days per month) with the 

following drugs: 

 

Drugs 

Chronic 

Migraine (15+ 

headache 

days per 

month)  

Episodic 

Migraine (15+ 

headache 

days per 

month)  

Erenumab     

Fremanezumab  0  0 

Galcanezumab  0  0 

Botulinum Toxin       
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Environmental Information (Scotland) Regulations 2004 

In accordance with FOISA s 17(1), NHS Shetland confirms that it does not hold the 

information requested as we are unable to provide numbers specifically relating to migraine. 


